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NATIONAL 
CONSTRUCTION 
AND CONSULTANT LLC 

3362 ROLLING HILLS LN. 

APOPKA, FL 32712 

()407-505-8623 0)407-541-7599 

REQUEST FOR BOARD INVESTIGATION 

Y24-719RM 

37th Street Sidewalk Project 

Orlando, FL 

23 April 2024 

1. National Construction and Consultant LLC is a, Minority/Woman/ Owned Company, A State and 
County Certified Disabled Veteran Owned Business and I am a State Licensed General 
Contractor. 

2. On (1 November 2023) National Construction and Consultant LLC was identified as the lowest 

bidder for this project at $783,856.43 and the project was awarded to a firm at $1,100,630.90. 
This award amount is $300,000 over the Orange Counties Estimated Costs of $785,928.14. 

3. On (14 March 2024) I was deemed Non-Responsive for (Non-Conforming Licensure) And 
Removed from The Low Bid List. 

4. NEVER received notification from Orange County Procurement or Rolando Melo via mail, email, 
or phone that there was a missing document with my bid. 

5. I should have had the opportunity to correct that deficiency. 

6. This was an unfair act by that department. 
7. Again (I was never notified). 

8. National Construction and Consultant has done projects for Orange County for more than 3 
years without any issues. 

9. I emailed (Supervisor) Mr. Melo on (12 January 2024) and he replied by saying ''The bids are still 
under the evaluation process" "If we need anything we will reach out to you". 

10. I assumed that there was nothing wrong with my bid. 
11. I don't think the procurement department did their "Do Diligence" To save the County Money. 

They never contacted the low bidder to request anything. 
12. I would like you to investigate what transpired and award me this contract. 
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FINAL: QUESTIONS THAT NEEDS TO BE ANSWERED: 

A. Why was National Construction and Consultant removed from the low bid list? 
B. At what time did Orange County Procurement notice that 1 document was missing? 
C. Did Orange County ever reach out to National Construction for missing information? If so, by 

what means. 
D. Does Orange County Procurement Office have any records showing that they tried to reach out 

to National Construction for missing information? 
E. How can Orange County Procurement justify paying another vendor $300,000 more than the 

lowest vendor to do the exact some job 7 
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November 1, 2023 Procurement Division \Vednesclay 

Internal Operations Centre II, 400 E. South Street, 2°d Floor 
*Opened Bids and Proposals* 

Y2-l-719-R2 
IFB 

Y24-716-GO 
IFB 

Y23-1061-l\1M 
IFB 

37th Street Sl<lewalk Project 
Estimated Cost: $785,928.14 

National Consm.1ction and Consultant LLC 

Stage Door II, Inc. 

W.T.Comp 

Schuller Contractors Incorporated 

Mercon Consu11ction Co. 

RMS Constructors Group. LLC 

Mejia International Group Corp. 

Energy Air, Inc. 

Network Craze 

The Reserves Network 

Unipak Corp. 

S783,856.43 

S904.139.00 

S954.716.06 

Sl.106.819.00 

S 1.170.230. 71 

S 1.230.043 .50 

S 1,904.795 .88 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

Orange County Convention Center (OCCC) North/ South 
Exte1·ior Canopy Ceiling Replacement 
Estimated Cost: Sl,630,394.00 

Sk-yBuilders USA. LLC 

Energy Air, Inc. 

Network Craze 

The Reserves Network 

Unipak Corp. 

Sl,584.695.47 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

:Maintenance and Repah· of Entrance Trailheads, Roacls ancl 
Trails, and Installation, Maintenance and Repab· of Low \Vater 
Crossings 

GRSC 

Habitat Restoration & Wildlife Protection Services, LLC 

1 

S685.500.00 

Sl.309.125.00 
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Gmail 

Ref: Project# Y24-719 

Rodney Bracy <bracybrcy@gmail.com> 
To: Rolando.melo@ocfl.net 

Good afternoon, 

fy y 

Rodney Bracy <bracybrcy@gmail.com> 

Thu, Jan 11, 2024 at 1 :33 PM 

I am Rodney Bracy with National Construction and Consultant LLC. It has been brought to my attention that I was the low 
bid for this project. I am doing a follow up to find out what is the next step in the awarding phase of this project. Can you 
please give me an update of this process along with the expected timeframe. Thank you very much, and you have a 
wonderful day. 

Mr. Rodney L. Bracy 



Gmail Rodney Bracy <bracybrcy@gmall.com> 

Ref: Project# Y24-719 

Melo, Rolando <Rolando.Melo@ocfl.net> 
To: Rodney Bracy <bracybrcy@gmail.com> 

Good Afternoon Rodney, 

The bids are still being evaluated at this moment, if we need anything we will reach out to you. 

Thanks, 

Rolando Melo, NIGP-CPP 
Contracts Supervisor I Procurement Division!Orange County Government 
400 E. South Street I Second Floor I Orlando, Florida 32801 
Phone: 407.836.56441 Email: Rolando.Melo@ocfl.net 

-Original Message---
From: Rodney Bracy <bracybrcy@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, January 11 , 2024 1 :33 PM 
To: Melo, Rolando <Rolando.Melo@ocfl.net> 
Subject: Ref: Project# Y24-719 

Fri, Jan 12, 2024 at 4:16 PM 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

Good afternoon, 

I am Rodney Bracy with National Construction and Consultant LLC. It has been brought to my attention that I was the low 
bid for this project. I am doing a follow up to find out what is the next step in the awarding phase of this project. Can you 
please give me an update of this process along with the expected timeframe. Thank you very much, and you have a 
wonderful day. 

Mr. Rodney L. Bracy 
PLEASE NOTE: Florida has a very broad public records law (F. S. 119). All e-mails to and from County Officials are kept 
as a public record. Your e-mail communications, including your e-mail address may be disclosed to the public and media 
at any time. 



Gmail Rodney Bracy <bracybrcy@gmail.com> 

----- - - -------------------------------
Ref: Project# Y24-719 

Rodney Bracy <bracybrcy@gmail.com> Wed, Apr 10, 2024 at 11:15AM 
To: "Melo, Rolando" <Rolando.Melo@ocfl.net> 

Good morning, This is Rodney Bracy with National Construction and Consultant LLC. My company was the lowest bidder 
on this project. I was wondering if there is release date scheduled for this project. 
[Quoted text hidden] 
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Gmail Rodney Bracy <bracybrcy@gmail.com> 

Ref: Project# Y24-719 

Rodney Bracy <bracybrcy@gmail.com> Fri, Apr 19, 2024 at 8:05 AM 
To: "Melo, Rolando" <Rolando.Melo@ocfl.net> 

Good morning, I reached out to you several times to get an update on this project and to find out if I needed to send you 
anything else. I never received a response. This was my first time applying for a major project with Orange County and 
you didn't make this a comfortable experience. 
(Quoted text hidden] 

.rt Y24-719RM Formal Protest Letter.pdf 
!Cl 854K 
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NATIONAL 
CONSTRUCTION 
AND CONSULTANT LLC 

3362 ROLLING HILLS LN. 

APOPKA, FL 32712 

()407-505-8623 0}407-541-7599 

REQUEST FOR BOARD INVESTIGATION 

EMAIL AND PHONE CALL CORRESPONDENCE 

Y24-719RM 

37th Street Sidewalk Project 

Orlando, FL. 

1. 9 January 2023, I Phone called Mr. Melo. I didn't get an answer. 

2. 11 January 2023, I Phone called Mr. Melo, Didn't get an answer. I left a message. 
3. Email to Mr. Melo on 11 Jan 2023 (Requesting update on project). 

4. Email reply from Mr. Melo on 12 Jan 2023 (I will contact you if we need anything). 

23 April 2024 

5. In person meeting on 16 Jan at the Orange County Convention Center with Mrs. Carrie Mathes 
(Manage) of Procurement. She was with another procurement employee. I inquired about the 

Y24-719 project. They said that they would check the progress of the bid out and get back to 
me. (They never did). 

6. 10 April 20241 emailed Mr. Melo to get an update on the project. I never received a reply. 
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.E1·0 
ORANGE CO TY PROCUREME T DlVISIO 
P BLIC POST~G- OTICE OF I TE T TO A\VARD 

Solicitation: In itati n for Bid Y24-7 l 9-R2 - 3 7th Str t Side, alk Project 

Tabulation: Bidder: 
Schuller Contractor Incorporated * 
Mercon Construction Co. 

RMS Constructors Group, LLC 

Mejia International Group Corp. 

National Construction and Consultant LLC * 

Stage Door ll, Inc. * 

W.T. Comp * 

~l~\-z4 -s >~(9.'3 
?\,i(~'< .~r~G<s 

Amount 
S l , 100,630.90 

Sl , 170.230.71 

S1 ,230,043.50 
Sl ,904,795.88 

Non Responsi e 

Non Responsi e 

on Re ponsible 

Recommendation: Award is recomm nded to Schuller Contractors Incorporated 

Remarks: Proc dural Remark 
Finn indicated ,, ith an asterisk (*) have received both Technical E aluation and Business 
D lopm nt E aluation (Minority and Woman O, ned Busines es). This e aluation is 
conducted from 10\ est to highe t and may not include all bidders based on bid volume and 
number of awards. 

aJuation Remarks 
\ .T. C mp. wa de m d non-re p n ible for refer nces non-conforming Similiar Proje t 
Requir ment . arional Con truction and Consultant LLC was deemed non re pon i e for 
non-conforming licen ure. Stag Door ll lnc. as deemed non-respon i e by the 
Pt1 curement Divi ion based on th analy is pro ided by the Busine De lopment 
Di i ion , hi h identifi d that the BE participation goal was not achi ved and 
ufficient g d faith effi rt d cumentari n was not provided. Price calculation errors by 

S huller C ntractors incorporated ar orr ted a shown. 

~ th~ ivision Manager 

3.6.2024 
Date 


