Orange County
BID TABULATION
Y24-1046-KS EMS Medications

Insert Line items pricing by Bidder Blaze Rescue

here Resources, LLC
Line No.1 $6,917.40
Line No.2 $1,740
Line No.3 No Bid
Line No.4 $468

Line No. 5 No Bid
Line No. 6 $1,534.80
Line No. 7 $1,485
Line No. 8 $4,496.70
Line No. 9 No Bid
Line No. 10 $18,000
Line No. 11 $6,600
Line No. 12 No Bid
Line No. 13 No Bid
Line No. 14 No Bid
Line No. 15 No Bid
Line No. 16 No Bid
Line No. 17 $5,716
Line No. 18 No Bid
Line No. 19 No Bid
Line No. 20 $125,276.40
Line No. 21 $2,248.50
Line No. 22 $33,000
Line No. 23 No Bid
Line No. 24 $33,300
Line No. 25 No Bid
Line No. 26 $1,020
Line No. 27 No Bid
Line No. 28 $17,790
Line No. 29 No Bid
Line No. 30 No Bid
Line No. 31 No Bid

Bound Tree

Medical, LLC

$2,348.40
$567.60
$1,5638.25
$280
$3,083.35
$572.40
$747
$3,546.30
$118
$11,321.20
$3,595.80
$5,940
$12,476
$40,165.20
$3,199
$54,498
$1,516
$1,082.40
$2,404.80
$42,300
$2,064
$9,300
$1,256
$16,080
$684
$897
$9.072.80
$7,783.80
$740
$751

$561

Drake
Pharmacy
Solutions

No Bid
$2,310
No Bid
No Bid
$2,811.25
No Bid
No Bid
$3,240
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$17,450
$71,280
No Bid
$62,250
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$29,250
$3,525
$24,531.25
No Bid
$37,065
No Bid
No Bid
$15,382
$9,523.50
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Life-Assist Inc.

$2535
$780
$1,400
$380
$3,125
$780
$1,018.50
$3,420
$122.50
$11,290
$3,450
$5,600
$15,500
$38,372.40
$3,710
$55,500
$3,116
$1,155
$3,780
$39,600
$4,350
$8,750
$1,400
$22,487.50
$897
$1,125
$7,508
$8,310
$1,200
$898
$325

Nashville Medical &
EMS Products, Inc.

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$7,812.50
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid



