GOVERNMENT

F 1. ORIDA

Interoffice Memorandum

March 29, 2017
TO: Mayor Teresa Jacobs
and the Board of County Commissioners
FQQM: Carrie Woodell, Manager, Procurement Division

CONTACT: Stephen Appoo, Fiscal Officer, Corrections Department
407-836-6706

SUBJECT: Award of Invitation for Bids Y17-191-MG, Inmate Apparel and
Bedding-Term Contract

ACTION REQUESTED:

Approval to award Invitation for Bids Y17-191-MG, Inmate Apparel and Bedding
— Term Contract, to the low responsive and responsible bidder per lot, for 1-year
term contracts (see below). Further request authorization for the Procurement
Division to renew the contracts for four additional 1-year terms.

Bob Barker Company, Inc. for Lots 1, 2, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 11, and 12 in the
estimated contract award amount of $309,197.50.

Tabb Textile Co., Inc. for Lot 10 in the estimated contract award amount of
$132,022.

PROCUREMENT:

This contract will provide inmate apparel and bedding on an as-needed basis.
Purchases may include inmate uniforms, under garments, sheets, blankets,
mattresses, mattress covers and towels.

FUNDING

Funding is available in account: 0001-081-3835-4115

APPROVALS:

The Corrections Department and the Business Development Division concur
with this recommendation.

REMARKS:

Eleven bids were received in response to the Invitation for Bids. The bids were

evaluated for price, responsiveness and responsibility. Uniform Manufacturing

Inc. is determined to be non-responsive for Lot 6 because their bid submitted for
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lines 40-43 deviated from the required units of measure. HR Cotton USA,
Carolina Textiles and Dana Safety Supply were deemed non-responsive for all
lots because their bids was not submitted on the revised bid form issued through
Addendum 2. Staff performed a technical evaluation of the bids and determined
that each low bid was reasonable based on market research and experience.
The bids of Bob Barker Company, Inc. and Tabb Textile Co., Inc. have been
determined to be the low responsive and responsible bidders for the lots listed
and are recommended for award. Therefore, award is recommended to Bob
Barker Company, Inc. for Lots 1, 2,4, 5,6, 7, 8, 9, 11 and 12, and Tabb Textile

Co., Inc. for Lot 10. Lot 3 was awarded within Procurement’s authority.

The bid tabulation is as follows:
LOT 1

Bob Barker Company, Inc.
Acme Supply Co., LTD
Uniform Manufacturing Inc.
Carolina Textiles

Dana Safety Supply

HR Cotton USA
Charm-Tex

Goaltex Corp.

0.D. Taragin & Bros LLC
Tabb Textile Co., Inc.

Wesvic's Clothing & Shoe Brokers, Inc.

LOT 2

Bob Barker Company, Inc.
Uniform Manufacturing Inc.
O.D. Taragin & Bros LLC
Acme Supply Co., LTD
Carolina Textiles

Dana Safety Supply

HR Cotton USA
Charm-Tex

Goaltex Corp.
Tabb Textile Co., Inc.

Wesvic's Clothing & Shoe Brokers, Inc.

$77,094.50
$77,621.50
$78,950.00

Non Responsive
Non Responsive
Non Responsive
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$2,070.00
$2,242.50
$3,702.50
$3,750.00

Non Responsive
Non Responsive
Non Responsive
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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LOT 3
Charm-Tex
Goaltex Corp.

Wesvic's Clothing & Shoe Brokers, Inc.

Bob Barker Company, Inc.
O.D. Taragin & Bros LLC
Carolina Textiles

Dana Safety Supply

HR Cotton USA

Acme Supply Co., LTD
Tabb Textile Co., Inc.
Uniform Manufacturing Inc.

LOT 4
Bob Barker Company, Inc.

Wesvic's Clothing & Shoe Brokers, Inc.

Goaltex Corp.

O.D. Taragin & Bros LLC
Carolina Textiles

Dana Safety Supply

HR Cotton USA

Acme Supply Co., LTD
Charm-Tex

Tabb Textile Co., Inc.

LOT S

Bob Barker Company, Inc.
Goaltex Corp.

Uniform Manufacturing Inc.
Charm-Tex

Wesvic's Clothing & Shoe Brokers, Inc.

Acme Supply Co., LTD
0O.D. Taragin & Bros LLC
Carolina Textiles

Dana Safety Supply

HR Cotton USA

Tabb Textile Co., Inc.

$15,360.00
$16,080.00
$16,920.00
$17,640.00
$32,880.00

Non Responsive
Non Responsive
Non Responsive
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$24,663.60
$26,364.00
$32,819.60
$41,264.60

Non Responsive
Non Responsive
Non Responsive
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$30,320.00
$32,640.00
$32,800.00
$33,840.00
$33,920.00
$34,000.00
$46,400.00

Non Responsive
Non Responsive
Non Responsive
No Bid
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LOT 6

Bob Barker Company, Inc.
Acme Supply Co., LTD
0.D. Taragin & Bros LLC
Carolina Textiles

Dana Safety Supply

HR Cotton USA

Uniform Manufacturing Inc.

Wesvic's Clothing & Shoe Brokers, Inc.

Charm-Tex
Goaltex Corp.
Tabb Textile Co., Inc.

LOT 7
Bob Barker Company, Inc.

Wesvic's Clothing & Shoe Brokers, Inc.

Acme Supply Co., LTD
Uniform Manufacturing Inc.
Charm-Tex

O.D. Taragin & Bros LLC
Carolina Textiles

Dana Safety Supply

HR Cotton USA

Goaltex Corp.

Tabb Textile Co., Inc.

LOT 8

Bob Barker Company, Inc.
Uniform Manufacturing Inc.
Acme Supply Co., LTD
O.D. Taragin & Bros LLC
Carolina Textiles

Dana Safety Supply

HR Cotton USA
Charm-Tex

Goaltex Corp.

Tabb Textile Co., Inc.

Wesvic's Clothing & Shoe Brokers, Inc.

$29,325.50
$33,000.00
$40,156.50

Non Responsive
Non Responsive
Non Responsive
Non Responsive
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$55,875.00
$56,690.50
$59,662.50
$61,710.00
$62,175.00
$70,277.00

Non Responsive
Non Responsive
Non Responsive
No Bid

No Bid

$27,331.65
$32,881.35
$34,430.00
$37,983.35

Non Responsive
Non Responsive
Non Responsive
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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LOT 9

Bob Barker Company, Inc. $9,147 .25
Charm-Tex $9,364.90
Wesvic's Clothing & Shoe Brokers, Inc. $9,588.00
Uniform Manufacturing Inc. $9,762.25
Acme Supply Co., LTD $11,756.25
0O.D. Taragin & Bros LLC $15,078.95
Carolina Textiles Non Responsive
Dana Safety Supply Non Responsive
HR Cotton USA Non Responsive
Goaltex Corp. No Bid
Tabb Textile Co., Inc. No Bid
LOT 10
Tabb Textile Co., Inc. $132,022.00
Acme Supply Co., Ltd $143,300.00
Charm-Tex $162,052.00
Bob Barker Company, Inc. $167,351.40
Carolina Textiles Non Responsive
Dana Safety Supply Non Responsive
Hr Cotton Usa Non Responsive
Goaltex Corp. No Bid
O.D. Taragin & Bros Llc No Bid
Uniform Manufacturing Inc. No Bid
Wesvic's Clothing & Shoe Brokers, Inc. No Bid
LOT 11

Bob Barker Company, Inc. $29,590.00
Charm-Tex v $36,180.00
Acme Supply Co., LTD $59,000.00
Carolina Textiles Non Responsive
Dana Safety Supply Non Responsive
HR Cotton USA Non Responsive
Goaltex Corp. No Bid
O.D. Taragin & Bros LLC No Bid
Tabb Textile Co., Inc. No Bid
Uniform Manufacturing Inc. No Bid

Wesvic's Clothing & Shoe Brokers, Inc. No Bid
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LOT 12

Bob Barker Company, Inc.
Acme Supply Co., LTD
Carolina Textiles

Dana Safety Supply

HR Cotton USA
Charm-Tex

Goaltex Corp.

0.D. Taragin & Bros LLC
Tabb Textile Co., Inc.
Uniform Manufacturing Inc.

Wesvic's Clothing & Shoe Brokers, Inc.

$23,780.00
$34,250.00

Non Responsive
Non Responsive
Non Responsive
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



Interoffice Memorandum

GOVERNMENT

BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT DIVISION

February 24, 2017

TO: Maria Guevara-Hall, Senior Purchasing Agent
Procurement Division

FROM: Kesi Warren, Senior Contract Administratdé,/
Business Development Division

SUBJECT: Business Development Division Bid Evaluation

PROJECT: IFB #Y17-191-MG, Inmate Apparel and Bedding

The Business Development Division evaluated the 8 bids submitted for this project and found that none
of the bidders are Orange County Certified Minority Women Business Enterprises. Hence, the bid
preference program in accordance with the County’s M/WBE Ordinance, Section 17-324 can not be
applied.

c: Sheena Ferguson, Manager, Business Development Division

Yhena, drguoon



